BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21

Bid Package - #2.10 - Building Demolition
Bid Tabulation

0w 2 L
T |ES §§ Alt #1 - Concrete | At #4-Sledding _
. . o S T 5 . Alt #2 - Alternate Alt #3 -Activ . Alt #5 - Vehicle
Company Name Bld Package Base Bid g o D = 2 Pavingin lieu of Lighting Fixtures |Coating on Glazing Hill Exhaust System
m 8§58 2 Asphalt Construction
<20
K.L.F. ENTERPRISES, INC. 2.10 $ 32,400.00 | Y Y
JOHLER DEMOLITION, INC. 2.10 $ 35,925.00 | Y Y Y
OMEGA Il LLC 2.10 $ 44,150.00 | Y | Y | Y
ALPINE DEMOLITION SERVICES, LLC 2.10 $ 64,200.00 | Y Y | 1-2
NATIONAL WRECKING COMPANY 2.10 $ 82,500.00 | Y Y Y
2.10
2.10
2.10

2.10




BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21

Bid Package - #2.20 - EXCAVATION & SITE UTILITIES

Bid Tabulation

=
5 2
= = ] i
B | 4 a Alt#1 AlL#2 Alt #3 -Activ |Alt #4 -Sledding| Alt #5 - Vehicle
. . S gz 5§52 Concrete Alternate . .
Company Name Bid Package Base Bid = S S| 2 S | pavingin lie of Lishtin Coating on Hill Exhaust
" v — = 1] J_g . .
o E ‘é Asphalt Fixtures Glazing Construction System
< |5
BERGER CONTRACTORS, INC. 2.20 $1,220,000.00 Y | Y |Y $9,000 -$130,000
DK CONTRACTORS, INC. 2.20 $1,408,069.00 Y | Y |Y $3,974 -$217,316
AMERICAN GRADING, INC. 2.20 $1,295,940.00 Y | Y |Y -$1,275 -$34,000
KANE COUNTY EXCAVATING, INC. 2.20 $1,781,365.00 Y | Y | Y NO BID -$120,500
2.20
2.20
2.20
2.20
2.20
2.20
2.20

2.20




BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21
Bid Package - #2.74 - ASPHALT PAVING

Bid Tabulation

3 3
= = ) )
£ E Z Cﬁ::rtte All\tl:lizate Alt#3 -Activ Alti#d - \?éi\?:le
. . = = 2 o Z . . . venice
Company Name Bid Package Base Bid ; 5> | £ 5| pavingintieu| Lightin COatm.gon SIeddlngﬂnll Exhaust
o c o g .g g Glazing Construction
K = of Asphalt Fixtures System
|8
ABBEY CONSTRUCTION CO, INC. 2.74 $135,545.00 Y Y Y | -$43,000
CHICAGOLAND PAVING CONTRACTORS 2.74 $129,000.00 Y Y Y | -$29,000
ACCU-PAVING CO. 2.74 $134,310.00 Y Y Y | -$14,500
CHADWICK CONTRACTING COMPANY 2.74 $144,490.00 Y Y 1 | $36,175
2.74
2.74
2.74
2.74
2.74
2.74

2.74




BID DATE: 8/22/24

Bid Package - #2.90 - LANDSCAPING

Bid Tabulation

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21

Company Name

Bid Package

Base Bid

Bid Bond

Addendums Noted

Y/N

Clarifications Noted
Y/N

Alt #1 - Concrete

Paving in lieu of
Asphalt

Alt #2 - Alternate

Lighting Fixtures

Alt #3 -Activ

Coating on
Glazing

Alt #4 -Sledding

Alt #5 - Vehicle

Hill Construction

Exhaust System

TWIN OAKS LANDSCAPING

2.90

$129,500.00

COOLING LAND CONCEPTS, LLC

2.90

$143,900.00

ALLIED LANDSCAPING CORPORATION

2.90

$145,315.00

BREEZY HILL LANDSCAPING

2.90

$175,100.00

< | < |=<|=<

< |=<|=<|=<

< |=<|=<|=<

2.90

2.90

2.90

2.90

2.90

2.90

2.90

2.90

2.90

2.90

2.90




BID DATE: 8/22/24

Bid Package - #4.00 - MASONRY WORK

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21

Bid Tabulation
= ] .
- Base Bid = | £2) 22| bommimiesr S| conen | eSS | e
& Asphalt Glazing

JOE'S MASONRY, INC 4.00 $705,200.00 Y | 1|1
G.C. MASONRY, INC 4.00 $786,000.00 Y | Y |Y
EBBEN MASONRY, INC. 4.00 $810,000.00 Y| Y |Y
ABLE MASONRY DEVELOPMENT 4.00 $831,527.00 Y| Y |Y
JIMMY'Z MASONRY CORP. 4.00 $843,000.00 Y| Y |Y
JAC MASONRY, INC. 4.00 $885,000.00 Y| Y |Y
MASTERSHIP CONSTRUCTION CO, INC. 4.00 $898,900.00 Y| Y |Y
RASCO MASON CONTRACTORS, INC. 4.00 $980,000.00 Y| Y| Y
MPZ MASONRY & CONSTRUCTION, INC. 4.00 $988,900.00 Y| Y |Y
IWANSKI MASONRY, INC. 4.00 $995,000.00 Y| Y| Y

4.00




BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21
Bid Package - #6.01 GENERAL TRADES

Bid Tabulation

3 |8
‘6 [=
T | =2 2 Alt #1 - Concrete
Companv Nam Bid Package B Bid 8 EE S 2z Paving in lieu of Alt #2 - Alternate Alt #3 -Activ Alt #4 -Sledding Hill| Alt #5 - Vehicle
pany Name pid rackage Base bid = 3> | 8> Lighting Fixtures | Coating on Glazing Construction Exhaust System
o g 8 Asphalt
£ |5
< o
CAMOSY INCORPORATED 6.01 $2,192,900.00 Y Y Y $65,400
LAUB CONSTRUCTION, INC. 6.01 $2,283,881.00 Y | Y | Y $67,184
6.01
6.01
6.01
6.01
6.01
6.01
6.01
6.01
6.01

6.01




BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21
Bid Package - #7.30 SHINGLE ROOFING & ARCHITECTURAL SHEET METAL

Bid Tabulation

Company Name

Bid Package

Base Bid

Bid Bond

Alt #1 - Concrete

Pavingin lieu of
Asphalt

Y/N
Y/N

Alt #2 - Alternate

Alt #3 -Activ Coating

Alt #4 -Sledding Hill

Alt #5 - Vehicle

Lighting Fixtures

on Glazing

Construction

Exhaust System

SEAL TIGHT EXTERIORS, INC.

7.30

$155,300.00

1-2

ALL AMERICAN EXTERIOR SOLUTIONS

7.30

$199,410.00

WEATHERGUARD ROOFING

7.30

$261,500.00

FILOTTO ROOFING, INC.

7.30

$264,900.00

< |=<|=<|=

< |=<|=<|=

7.30

7.30

7.30

7.30

7.30

7.30

7.30

7.30




BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21

Bid Package - #8.40 - ALUMINUM FRAMING, GLASS & GLAZING

Bid Tabulation
Company Name 14 Packase Base Bld E z| £z ‘I\::;'g?n°3:;e: Alt#2-Alternate | Alt #3-Activ Coating | Alt #4-Sledding Hill | Alt #5- Vehicte
¥ ’ S g - E > > Asphalt Lighting Fixtures on Glazing Construction Exhaust System
C.A.D. CONTRACT GLAZING 8.40 $185,810.00 Y | Y |Y $4,745
RELIANT CONTRACT GLASS, INC. 8.40 $198,800.00 Y Y Y NO BID
3F CORPORATION 8.40 $226,600.00 Y| Y | Y $6,400
8.40
8.40
8.40
8.40
8.40
8.40
8.40

8.40




BID DATE: 8/22/24

Bid Tabulation

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21
Bid Package - #9.26 - METAL FRAMING, DRYWALL, & INSULATION

3 |2
s |2
2|4 g |Alt#l-Concrete) o Atternate | “*3A™N | 444 Sledding | Alt#5- Vehicle
B . [= g2 c 2 T l . - -
Company Name Bid Package Base Bid ; 3 = = > | Pavinginlieu of Lighting Fixtures Coatm. on Hill Construction | Exhaust System
o g L Asphalt Glazing
3 5
< o
THE ROCKWELL GROUP, INC. 9.26 $643,400.00 Y Y Y
DBM SERVICES, INC. 9.26 $674,300.00 Y Y Y
CHAMPION DRYWALL, INC. 9.26 $716,510.00 Y Y | 1-2
OPC CONSTRUCTION GROUP, INC. 9.26 $729,950.00 Y Y Y
HEITKOTTER, INC. 9.26 $748,690.00 Y Y Y
LAUB CONSTRUCTION, INC. 9.26 $967,777.00 Y Y Y
9.26
9.26
9.26

9.26




BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21
Bid Package - #9.67 EPOXY FLOORING SYSTEM

Bid Tabulation

©
D e
S = Alt #1 - Alt #2 - Alt#4- Alt #5
T | Z n Alt #3 -Activ| Sledding _
Company Name Bid Package Base Bid 2 | EZ|5z| Concrete | Alternate | . o inson| Hill Vehicle
R T | § > | & > |Pavinginlieu| Lighting ) .| Exhaust
[~ = Q . Glazing |Constructio
2 = of Asphalt Fixtures n System
=2 3 a
ARTLOW SYSTEMS, INC. 9.67 $93,586.00 Y Y Y
MENCONI TERRAZZO 9.67 $94,800.00 Y [1-2] 1-2
MS SEBASTIAN PAINTING, INC. 9.67 $127,185.00 Y Y Y
CCI FLOORING, INC. 9.67 $129,100.00 N 1 |12
BLAST IT ALL MIDWEST 9.67 $129,413.00 Y Y Y
UNITED SLAB SOLUTIONS (INCOMPLETE) 9.67 $80,000.00 Y N N
9.67
9.67

9.67




BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21
Bid Package - #9.90 - PAINTING AND WALL COVERINGS

Bid Tabulation
o ) .
suracs Base bid B I e o BT o P
& Asphalt Glazing
G.P. MAINTENANCE SERVICES, INC. 9.90 $75,600.00 Y | Y |Y
NEDROW PAINTING 9.90 $76,450.00 Y | Y |Y
OOSTERBAAN & SONS CO. 9.90 $77,690.00 Y | Y |Y
MIDWEST DECORATING, INC. 9.90 $87,670.00 Y | Y |Y
MS SEBASTIAN PAINTING, INC. 9.90 $88,411.00 Y | Y |Y
JDR PAINTING 9.90 $106,658.00 N Y Y
9.90
9.90
9.90
9.90
9.90




BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21

Bid Package - #15.30 - FIRE PROTECTION
Bid Tabulation

3 2
“6 (=
= Z % | At#1-Concrete Alt #3 -Activ
Combanv Nam Bid Package B Bid 8 g z S 2 Paving in lieu of Alt #2 - Alternate m Alt #4 -Sledding | ALt #5 - Vehicle
ompany € FlidFackage Base bld = 3> 7 > Lighting Fixtures .g Hill Construction| Exhaust System
o S £ Asphalt Glazing
S E
< o
NELSON FIRE PROTECTION 15.30 $55,151.00 Y Y Y
AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEMS, INC. 15.30 $69,848.00 Y Y Y
ABSOLUTE FIRE PROTECTION, INC. 15.30 $76,600.00 Y Y Y
S.J. CARLSON FIRE PROTECTION, INC. 15.30 $84,473.00 Y 1-2 Y
VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS, LLC 15.30 $111,000.00 Y Y Y
15.30
15.30
15.30

15.30




BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21

Bid Package - #15.40 - PLUMBING

Bid Tabulation
3 |8
*5 [=
= E Alt #1 - Concrete
. pL = Alt #2 - Alternate | Alt #3 -Activ Coating | Alt #4 -Sledding Hill Alt #5 - Vehicle
. E 2 o 2 . . .
o— g - . . . H
Company Name Bid Package Base Bid g 3 B ® > Pavingin lieu of Lighting Fixtures on Glazing Construction Exhaust System
g & Asphalt
3 |3
< O
EWING-DOHERTY MECHANICAL 15.40 $334,860.00 Y Y Y
ERNIE PETERSEN PLUMBING, INC. 15.40 $339,800.00 Y Y Y
MARTIN PETERSEN COMPANY, INC. (INCOMPLETE) 15.40 $406,900.00 Y Y Y
DEFRANCO PLUMBING, INC. 15.40 $439,500.00 Y Y Y
CW BURNS CO., INC. (INCOMPLETE) 15.40 $455,300.00 Y Y Y
A&H PLUMBING & HEATING (INCOMPLETE) 15.40 $475,300.00 Y Y Y
15.40
15.40
15.40
15.40




BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21
Bid Package - #15.80 - HVAC

Bid Tabulation
3 |3
s |2 |2 .
- Base Bid S £2/ B2 mimnler | st | it WSSO st
= § g Asphalt (Plymovent)
< |3
DEKALB MECHANICAL INC. 15.80 $790,000.00 Y | Y | Y $88,000
AMBER MECHANICAL CONTRACTORS, INC. 15.80 $783,000.00 Y Y Y $96,000
AIR SUPPLY AC & HEATING 15.80 $815,000.00 Y | Y | Y $91,500
C. ACITELLI HEATING & PIPING CONCTRACTORS, INC. 15.80 $820,000.00 Y | Y | Y $95,000
FLO-TECH MECHANICAL SYSTEMS, INC. 15.80 $828,000.00 Y | Y | Y $95,000
MARTIN PETERSEN COMPANY, INC. 15.80 $828,400.00 Y | Y | Y $86,200
JENSEN'S PLUMBING & HEATING, LLC. 15.80 $874,000.00 Y | Y | Y $112,000
MG MECHANICAL CONTRACTING, INC. 15.80 $912,000.00 Y | Y | Y NO BID
MCDONOUGH MECHANICAL SERVICES (INCOMPLETE) 15.80 $672,900.00 Y | Y | Y $86,200
15.80
15.80




BID DATE: BID DATE: 8/22/24

VILLAGE OF HOFFMAN ESTATES FIRE STATION #21

Bid Package - #16.00 - Electrical

Bid Tabulation

3 |2
2 % g Alt #1 - Concrete Alt#3-Activ. | Alt #4 -Sledding .
Company Name Bid Package Base Bid g 5 S| £ | Pavingin tieu of f:;:tzm: Ltui::::: Coatingon HiL m
o S L Asphalt Glazing Construction
3 | E
< |5
CAREY ELECTRIC CONTRACTING 16.00 $829,750.00 Y | Y |Y -$4,000
KELLENBERGER ELECTRIC, INC 16.00 $835,000.00 Y | Y |Y -$35,000
HY-POWER ELECTRIC COMPANY 16.00 $875,425.00 Y | Y |Y NO BID
MK INDUSTRIES, INDUSTRIES 16.00 $892,692.00 Y | Y |Y -$25,000
ASSOCIATED ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS, LLC 16.00 $909,336.00 Y | Y |Y NO BID
MONARCH ELECTRIC CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 16.00 $1,038,000.00 Y Y Y NO BID
PUBLIC ELECTRIC CONSTRUCTION CO 16.00 $1,046,666.00 Y | Y |Y NO BID
J. HAMILTON ELECTRIC CO, INC. 16.00 $1,084,000.00 Y | Y |Y NO BID
16.00
16.00
16.00

16.00




